~ : -

R - Y :
. Wed 4. Adefiua/vo-303/Tadama/003-04

| W BEaRl qU, 00Y/HE ¢, TP &Y
S AP FUH BIEA SIUAMIE A1 WA RS I Hois 2331 amea,
HET ATI-H

TERTS, A HERTS AT TR B (VR U, Th-31 1T vap-a7
T AR dod M 7 Rk giafiRew) faw T s,

UTHAPT T SRR 9T
HAT, &% goo 032, fAATF 6 Bgar) 00y

. e
Y3 ArUETaa IfAfTd, aqyc. .

PHIG FINCA. ERY/NAR. 2009/H3MR-y (32).——Fa$ TmT=RE FRFE, 9-ye
(9R4R =N Hag 3) TTeAT Hem g TN We-FHer () T S (W) T (FRES)
ATER Y HRVAT ATeled] SR i rarada s wmel s 3a” 0d
HABRTI IR B HERTS AT {9 Riegt qravemad (arefieey g aran) fam,
WYL AT UG JERUN OGRS S e aroary difdrel e« Frera géra
AT TWIER q1e dTarauard TRran SRTeled] ¥d eadied] AiRdiaRadr Sad dorm 908,
=1 IIE-Het (¥) R ITaeddh HeUTHATY, ATER GRIG HRUATT A MM 1 A 3
AT AT A TR B, I A, HENT, I 1 99 BEAr) 00y i fba

M IR-9-Yy% ) (QL&C)

(} Scanned with OKEN Scanner



:«w
Gy WERTS IR NOITH, SRl BFATG 90, 2008/ATH ¢, WH 993y [‘"7'*%}'{;
:;\1

2 Ta S GAT, P AAFAEGA S BITE AT 7 ey
w, TEITA W(?da RIS 2M{E, I IG GRS I()HI’I, W, ﬂ?r;.‘ Yoo 033 .qmﬂ 'j:
ddte, @R ARG AR HReam AgA. T

yere .
q. 1 I jag aHeEad (Aefie e @ @) (GURen) fFrag, 500y I oy
A A vy

2 HwE wmdEad (3 Waew g o) fHam, q%amﬁmuﬁzw’%ﬁ_,

SN HYOTTd s —— A oy
"o, TG, mmﬁ?ﬁuaﬁmqssmqﬁﬁmﬁm%;
el Oy

SRl o] ST 0.3y TFD 3D 9 et )

Wmmmaw
BT T
M= 39wy

N

& Scanned with OKEN Scanner



A

S

Seay

AERA] RIS W X, SHATMIRY, Bt at, 2004/ 3¢, 75 9324 90

RURAL DEVELOPMENT AND WATER CONSERVATION

DEPARTMENT .
ai 400 032, dated thel7th February 2004

NOTIFICATION
BoMBAY VILLAGE PANCHAYATS Acr, 1958,

Mantralaya, Mumb

illage Panchayats Act, 1958 (Bom. III of
1959), and Oﬁ}II other powers enabling it in that behalf, is hereby

published as &juired by sub-section (4) of the said section 176 for the
information of all persong likely to be affected therby, and notice is hereby
given that the said draft wi]] be taken into consideration by the Govern-
ment of Maharashtra on or after the 17th day of February 2004.

2. Any objections and sy

Government.

vy DRAFT RULES
1. These rules may be called the Bombay Villa

| ge Panchayats (B udget
and Accounts) (Amendment) Rules, 2004.

2. Forrule7 ofthe Bombay Village Panchayats (Budget and Accounts)
Rules, 1959, the following rule shall be substituted, namely :(—

“7. A Panchayat shall contribute, every financia] ye
Village Development Fund constituted under section 133, 0.25 per cent.
of itsincome raised during the preceding financial year from all sources
(including contributions from the State Government).”,

ar, to the District

¢

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

KUNDA GOSAVI,
Deputy Secretary to Government.

(} Scanned with OKEN Scanner



159 WENI VIR NISIUH, IRTIRVI, BFAR) 90, 008/716 2¢, i Wy |
3¢ T"‘l )
il

ARTT T STerRigRY A y

A, Ay oo 03, Retid 0 hgard) 00y
fergE
Ha§ IaaTE AT, aqye,

BB TN ARQ/MNAR. Y0109/ N4 (33). 148 17721 Aif
(q,w RS 3) AN B Gt w1 e den () = wg (F.ﬁ?)‘?f). anifi -er'f' 1
TEN A HYom aﬂiv\to?ﬂ ST 3y e @ el ATy M ke
STRRIRTN AT W, WERTS: WA, e Rreer 7 R fre) fry ,1(;7,W’f"'5
STOT) SR YT S e avaty e o Pt e e
‘«n}en RIS TRl SRR e miRdwRaT 97 e ; 5; me ' ff,"/f
(¥) ER 3mava® FATITH AER g BRUTT et o anfiy AT emr;ﬁgm‘ég j

flﬁ&ﬂ%ﬁ?ﬁﬂ qe] 3 - . .
m TURT HENTS: AR 7 90 dygamdy R008 M el Ty fogpy

;qsmm@ﬁmmwmmamwm@gam
mj fevan sz, nmvﬁa,aﬁrwmﬁ,mﬁmmﬁwm,w LCERTE ',
Wﬁawwﬁ'ﬂwm - "

‘

mmmm)mﬁmaw}, are-fRrm (2) R, qdiet dre-Fraw wAfe

XIS4T 71 ) Areterean simeraon 'ﬁ o ?.‘m@ﬁm
! HNMWWWW.GWWWW%WWW

PIVTAE 2T ATHROTR AR HTEY, ey 3 TSI Fore)
R , 39 < ﬁ—éﬁ
Foedl T RAbs e A B 72

CX Scanned with OKEN Scanner



/N
kel RIS T T, SRR, q\’m 90, 00%/MTE J, THI]Y
3 T umten P o3 ey o
() P (q) m

2 q1 q(ﬂqﬁﬂi!ar,n 2 3 ' :H.E..p[ "
& AR I R A 3 i i

(S9) oRen wgwm, -~ dur a8 TRy, R a4y

%R

TR TS BRI g
(W) - (). = wqemmy -

4
G
2,
2
?L
2
L
.
:
3
i

HERTSIT RToquTet mananésnamz T A,

-]

AT Y i,

CE Scanned with OKEN Scanner



3 TERTS. ¥R SIS, IR, Bgard) 90, 008/7T 3¢, WD WY [91M ARy

RURAL DEVELOPMENT AND WATER CONSERVATION |
DEPARTMENT |
Mantralaya, Mumbai 400 032, dated thel7th February 2004

NOTIFICATION ‘ |
BoMBAY VILLAGE PANCHAYATS Acr, 1958,

read with section 133 of the Bombay Village Panchayats Act, 1958 (Bom
III of 1959), and of all other powers enabling it in that behal
published as required by sub-section (4) of the said secti 1 76 for the
information of all persons likely to be affected thereby, and A&_ is hereby
given that the said draft will be taken into consideration by the Govern-
ment of Maharashtra on or after the 17th day of February 2004.

2. Any objections and suggestions which may

DRAFT RULES

1. Theserules may be called the Bombay District Village Develent
Fund (Amendment) Rules, 2004.

bl

principal Rules ”), after sub-rule (2),
the following sub-rule shall be inserted, namely :—

“(2-a) If it comes to the notjce of the State Government that a consider-
able amount is remained unused in the District Village Development Fund,
and there are no proportionate demands of loan, and also such fund is
required for the development of rural areas, in such circumstances the State
Government may instruct the Standing Committee to allocate out of the
certain percentage of such fund to the Panchayats as a loan for
implementation of the Yeshwant Gram Samruddhi Yojana of the State
Government, in proportion to the extent of balance contribution amqunt of
the concerned panchayat. On such loan no any interest as mentioned in ru_le
13 shall be charged. However, such interest free loan shall be repayable in
the manner prescribed in rule 12.”.

(} Scanned with OKEN Scanner



‘)'
!

yed] RIS A NG, SFATEIRUL, gaT<l o, 2008/HTel J¢, 7105 993y 984

g In rule 12 of the principal Rules,—
(a) in sub-rule (1),—

(i) for the words “ not exceeding ten years ” the words “ not exceeding
twenty years ” shall be substituted ;

(ii) in the first proviso, for the words “fifteen years ” the words
“twenty-five years ” shall be substituted ;

(b) in the proviso to sub-rule (2),—

(i) for the words “ten years” the words “twenty years” shall be
substituted ;

(it) for the words “ ﬁftéen years ” the words “ twenty-five years”
shall} 7 ~ubstituted ;

-

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

KUNDA GOSAVI,
- Deputy Secretary to Government.

AMGDHY AL GUTTerd, Has

(} Scanned with OKEN Scanner



